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THE LIFE AND PURPOSE 
of 

Dan P. Davison 
 

On the cold night of December 9, 1945 a team of horses were harnessed in a small town of 
Conneautville, Pennsylvania, USA and driven by a young man to bring the country doctor for the 
home birth of his son.  The roads were impassable and snow drifts more than 10 feet high.  That man 
was the Father of Dan Paul Davison. A difficult birth and immediate milk allergies caused the doctor 
to suggest the child would not live for any longer than 6 weeks. 
 

Born to a solid farming family with values and virtues surrounding clean lives, helping your 
neighbour, working tirelessly with no thought of ever giving up on a task and being constantly self-
sufficient, the life was molded at a young age.  Respect for humanity, animals and the earth as a 
means of safety, community and purpose was instilled at a young age and became an intuitive means 
of daily life. 
 

The second of 5 children, the pioneering and challenging intrigue of Northern Canada with the 
openness of wilderness and natural wildlife kept calling to Dan’s Father who eventually followed his 
dream taking a family to a 200 acre abandoned farm in Haliburton, Ontario, Canada.  Logging, 
hunting, farming and carving life from nature empowered the dream of adventure, new beginnings 
and tenacious creation which left a mark on the children. 
 

This life of basic self-sufficiency, adventure, creativity and determination has allowed Dan to be 
comfortable today milking 50 dairy cows in a family farm, harvesting crops, volunteer teaching in 
prisons, developing global strategic designs and sitting in boardrooms of Wall Street, Toronto, 
Bermuda or Switzerland with bankers, lawyers, brokers and corporate leaders from many industries.  
The same honesty of character and transparent, non-adversarial values bring quick resolution to 
difficult challenges through experience and intuition.   
 

After high school, Dan decided to pursue a career at General Motors in Oshawa, Ontario, Canada at 
age 18.  Entering the Transportation Department, he quickly embraced more responsibility than 
required with much common sense and mature wisdom, filling supervision roles without title.  The 
rule of the day at GM was “no management jobs for people under 30 years old”.  At 26, Dan was 
invited to be Assistant Manager of a large Trucking, Rail and Warehousing operation with a staff of 
Teamsters that created a quick-study regarding Contracts, Strikes, Grievances and delicate 
relationships.  He implemented work flows and systems immediately that yielded a 35% increase in 
productivity with less supervision and empowerment of the people without conflict. 
 

His career was a continuum of being invited to better, more responsible and challenging roles in a 
number of corporations, usually where there were serious systems and management problems.  
Taking the complex and making it simple and non-adversarial with all involved quickly created 
instant success and improved productivity constantly.  Thus, promotions and opportunities came 
yearly. 
 

In a string of management positions in Toyota Canada leading to National Transportation Manager 
at 30 years old with 5 Departments, an annual budget of $34 million annually and a national staff, the 
stage was set for further opportunities.  CBC Television called and requested he consider a position 
to build and manage an inventory system to handle over one million TV Commercial spots on 15 
Owned and Operated Stations. The current system managed the selling of local and national spots on 
a paper spread sheet system using telephone orders.  Within 2 years, a multi-entry timed system was 
in place using software and processing from a large service provider in USA.  
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Consulting had an intrigue and the “pioneering atmosphere” called Dan to becoming a Professional 
Facilitator with expertise in Strategic Planning, Organizational Development and Collaborative 
Planning through simple work process flow and Project Management.  Both consulting and teaching 
the art became part of the next few years.  Industries in which Dan worked were Mining, Real Estate 
Development, Food Corporations, Oil Companies, Insurance Industry, Banking (domestic and off-
shore), Trust Companies, E-Com and large Pension Funds. 
 

Having this broad knowledge, Dan eventually settled in a large Canadian Bank, CIBC, working as an 
internal consultant bringing a common strategic planning methodology and facilitating hundreds of 
workshops enabling each department to precisely point to the vision of the bank.  This allowed for a 
simple roll-up of plans and budgets and doubled the systems development productivity of Corporate 
Bank in 2 years while reducing costs substantially. 
 

This accomplishment led to an appointment as Director, Strategic Planning, Office of the Chairman 
where he rationalized some 400 funded projects and found that 25% of the projects had tasks, 
functions and deliverables that were common to other projects duplicating costs and creating conflict 
leading to costly inefficiencies.  Duplications in development functions in systems development 
amounted to close to $100 million per year. 
 

A change was required in the path of Dan Davison.  Although he had remarkable success in the 
corporate world, there was an underlying passion that would not go away.  In the most simple and 
philosophical terms, Dan always wanted to see Corporations and Business be more socially 
responsible - - and Social Organizations be more fiscally responsible, eventually bringing the two 
together in a social-economic model of stewardship of humanity.  He set out to work, create and 
build such structures with various business owners.  The result was a few years of “experimental lab” 
environments that in some cases improved and others were not ready. 
 

Having a vast broad business experience, this passion drew Dan toward social organizations as a 
volunteer in numerous organizations to fulfill the other half of the vision.  From becoming a life skills 
coach for autistic adolescence and mentally challenged persons, to teaching on the ranges of prisons 
working with Young Offenders, the need for more effective integrated systems and principles were 
determined.  Front line work with Street Youth, the disadvantaged and poor of city ghettos and a 
desire to create schools for these people took him to crack houses and abandoned warehouses 
bringing g food, clean socks and encouragement to the lowest possible living environments.  Today 
many people are working, are in successful relationships and focused on hope and dreams as a result 
of his continuous and dedicated counsel and friendship.  His principles, concepts work and many 
lives are proof that this element of society can change given a reasonable chance. His secret was 
found in his mantra of “in all relationships I will put in more than I take out”.  That includes the most 
disadvantaged people in the world. 
 

The linking with business as a gateway to new life for so many talented people suitable for trades, 
crafts and other creative and manual vocations is practical.  This experience and passion resulted in a 
book written by Dan called “Send The Angels”. The book outlines a new social economic structure 
for developing youth in the realms of welfare recipients, street kids and Young Offenders that 
requires NO government funding and brings about a system where all facets of society win, and that 
not at the expense of others.  This describes a significant shift to a new paradigm in social design, 
with intentions of developing the concepts into a world model.  
The path that Dan took in the following years married both the vast and diverse business 
development experience across many industries and non-profit entities, the time came to design of a 
complete Self-Sustainable Community that can be quickly duplicated and facilitated to 1000 
locations around the world quickly.  The basic components are determined and address all facets of 
collaborative and equitable social-economic wellness in systems that clearly portray a life of Unity, 
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yet Liberty.   The result is a self-sustainable human experience for living that meets all needs 
emotionally, intellectually, physically and spiritually. 
 

In the past, Dan has been involved in the development of a Green Energy company in Canada called 
Prasino Energy Systems Inc. (Prasino means “Green” in Greek).  As CEO and chief strategic 
designer of this entity, the integration of energy, linked to 5 other industry categories has resulted in 
links to food and farm activities, banking and currency, transportation and communication, health and 
wellness, and training and education, becoming a base for self-sustainable communities.  All of these 
entities are in development stages at some degree of completion. 
 

Currently, Dan is fostering and championing a “Business Development Corporation” called Double 
Helix Management Services Ltd. in Bermuda.  This asset management entity will specialize in the 
multi-trillion dollar conservation, self-sustainable and energy related programs initiated globally in 
the next 5 years.  Particular focus will be given to the needs of the Self-Sustainable Communities and 
individual projects for financing and project management.  “Gold-Green Unit Trusts are being 
developed with holdings of 50% Gold Bullion and 50% Infra-Structure sustainable projects to 
enhance and support Self-Sustainable Communities Globally.   
 

The Slogan for Double Helix Management Services Ltd. (DHMS Ltd) is “Leaders in discreet and 
responsible stewardship”  The prime objective of the organization and programs are to facilitate a 
better way with sustainability at the core of any action. 
 

Dan’s strong conviction to institute all change and betterment of humanity and the related systems to 
build wellness in all aspects of the world is through “Empowerment and NOT Control”.  In every 
facet of development and design, there must be the balance to move forward through “empowerment 

of” rather than “power over” each and every sovereign soul that is touched. Empowerment from 
within is the only self-sustainable method of carrying on humanity in the new civilization to come.  
Control creates shifts, becomes distorted and destructive and vanishes with the power-broker of the 
day, be it a person or a system. The end result of any system based on external control is destined 
without exception to a global implosion eliminating most of the inhabitants and life.   
 

Dan’s vision and passion is to practically implement as many business and social entities globally 
with design and structures that empower all of humanity with ultimate regard for the equality of the 
soul and respects the earth.  Something that will definitely occur as our current civilization erodes to 
serious challenge until a younger generation becomes the phoenix of the new earth.  It can be done 
and will be done as individuals see themselves as empowered with liberty and freedom to become the 
reality of their own hearts.   Dan feels there is no price too large to pay to help the noble cause of 
making a difference, even if to only one soul or element of the earth. 
 
 
 

Should every individual on earth dare to embrace the ideal of becoming the total essence of 

Unconditional Love, Unlimited Creativity, Unparalleled Peace and Unprecedented Prosperity, 

could we not collectively bring Heaven to Earth?   (by dan davison) 
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